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Jonathan Rogness earned his doctorate in topology at the University of 
Minnesota and is now an assistant professor of mathematics at that 
school. He is well known for his beautiful mathematical visualizations, 
including an award-winning video, Möbius Transformations Revealed, 
which went viral online and has been viewed by nearly two million 
people. Professor Rogness loves to make complex mathematical ideas 
accessible to students of all ages and was recently named the new 
Director of the University of Minnesota’s Mathematics Center for 
Educational Programs, which runs one of the nation’s premier 
accelerated mathematics programs for middle school students. 

Zhonghong Jiang is a professor of mathematics education at Texas State 
University. His research interests include the use of technology, problem 
solving, mathematical modeling, and the impact of these aspects on 
student learning and teacher preparation. His scholarship also focuses on 
developing instructional materials, working with students from 
underrepresented groups, and inservice teachers’ professional 
development. He writes extensively on all these issues. Over the years, 
he has been the principal investigator or a co-principal investigator of 
many research grants funded by the National Science Foundation and 
other funding agencies. 

Alexander White is an associate professor of mathematics education at 
Texas State University. He has research interests in mathematics 
education, statistics and mathematical finance. In mathematics education 
he has authored several papers concerning the ability of students entering 
calculus to visualize functions and work with graphs. He has worked on 
application of statistical models to assessment of educational systems in 
Central America. He is working on the development of a new middle 
school mathematics curriculum with Texas Mathworks, a center for 
mathematics education. 

Alana Rosenwasser is a doctoral student in mathematics education at 
Texas State University. After earning her BS in mathematics, her 
interests turned to mathematics education while working at a local high 
school. She currently works as a graduate research assistant for the 
Dynamic Geometry in Classrooms Project. Her responsibilities for the 
project include assisting with instrument development, professional 
development, and curriculum development. Her dissertation, which uses 
data from the project, is about assessing conjecturing and proving ability. 
Her research interests include assessment, knowledge for teaching, and 
the development of reasoning abilities. 

Michael Todd Edwards, edwardm2@muohio.edu, is co-director of the 
GeoGebra Institute of Ohio and co-editor of the Midwest GeoGebra 
Journal (www.ggbmidwest.com/journal). His professional interests focus 
on the use of technology in the teaching and learning of school 
mathematics with particular emphasis on dynamic mathematics software. 
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Dana C. Cox, dana.cox@muohio.edu, teaches prospective elementary 
and secondary teachers at Miami University in Oxford, Ohio. She is 
interested in curriculum design and the role of technology in the teaching 
and learning of mathematics. 
 
 
 

Diane R. Murray is a Mathematics Education Ph.D. candidate at 
Teachers College, Columbia University. She is the Online Editor for the 
JMETC and is currently serving on the editorial board for the Teachers 
College Mathematical Modeling Handbook and is assisting in the 
preparation of its follow-up companion handbook focusing on 
assessment. For the past year, she has been a research assistant working 
with Dr. Alexander Karp and Dr. Erica Walker on an online teacher 
resource. Diane has taught mathematics courses at Manhattanville 
College and Lehman College. Her research interests include the history 
of mathematics education, technology use in the mathematics classroom, 
and the study of material objects in mathematics education. 

Heather Gould is a Ph.D. candidate at Teachers College, Columbia 
University. She is currently serving as the editorial board chair for the 
Teachers College Mathematical Modeling Handbook and is assisting in 
the preparation of its companion handbook on mathematical modeling 
assessment. Her academic interests include mathematical modeling, 
pedagogical preparation of college mathematics instructors, and 
mathematics language acquisition. 

Catherine Reimer is a career-changer, now teaching Algebra to eighth 
grade students at The School at Columbia. She recently graduated with a 
Masters in Secondary Mathematics Education from Teachers College, 
Columbia University. Prior to teaching mathematics, Catherine spent 
over seven years in the financial services industry working as a software 
developer and project manager at Bloomberg LP and BlackRock. 
Catherine earned her undergraduate degrees from Johns Hopkins 
University in both Computer Science and Applied Mathematics. 

Kurt Kreith is Professor Emeritus of Mathematics at the University of 
California at Davis. He received his PhD at UC Berkeley under Frantisek 
Wolf and has combined his interest in pedagogy with an academic career 
in mathematics. In retirement he has served as acting co-director of the 
California Mathematics Project and as instructor in the California State 
Summer School for Mathematics and Science (Cosmos). He also offers a 
series of technology-based First Year Seminars at UC Davis dealing with 
basic number theory, cryptology, and global change. Together with G.D. 
Chakerian, he has written Iterative Algebra and Dynamic Modeling 
(Springer Verlag, 1999) and Teaching Mathematics Using Technology 
(McDougal Littell, 2002). 



 

 Journal of Mathematics Education at Teachers College 
86 Technology Issue       Fall–Winter 2011, Volume 2 

ABOUT THE AUTHORS 

Kathleen Offenholley is an Assistant Professor of Mathematics at the 
Borough of Manhattan Community College, and a Steering Committee 
member of the CUNY Games Network, http://games.commons.gc.cuny. 
edu/, a group that connects educators from every campus and discipline 
within the City University of New York who are interested in games, 
simulations, and other forms of interactive teaching. 
 

Sandra Y. Okita is an Assistant Professor of Technology and Education 
at Teachers College, Columbia University. She is the director of the 
Sociable Technology and Learning Lab (STL). Her work uses innovative 
technologies (robots, mixed reality devices, virtual reality environments) 
as a threshold to learning, instruction, and assessment. Other research 
areas include self-other monitoring, learning by teaching, learning by 
observation, in the domain of mathematics, biology, and science. 
 

Azadeh Jamalian is a Ph.D. student in Cognitive Studies in Education 
program at Teachers College, Columbia University. Azadeh’s research 
agenda is a hybrid of early mathematical education, gesture and its role 
on abstract thinking, and game design. She has been the main researcher 
and designer for many projects focusing on mathematics and 
technology—MathemAntics, Projo, and BoogieBash games are examples 
of such projects. 
 

Alice Welt Cunningham is a graduate of Yale College and Harvard Law 
School and received her master’s and doctoral degrees in Mathematics 
Education from Columbia University. Her teaching experience includes 
tax law; and junior high, high school, and college mathematics. She is 
currently Assistant Professor of Mathematics at Hostos Community 
College, City University of New York. 
 

Olen Dias had earned her master’s degree in Mathematics from Queens 
College, CUNY and doctoral degree in pure mathematics from the 
Graduate Center of City University of New York (CUNY). She taught as 
an adjunct in several campuses of CUNY for many years. Currently She 
is working as an Assistant Professor of Mathematics at Hostos 
Community College, CUNY. 
 

Dr. Nieves Angulo is an Assistant Professor in the Mathematics 
Department, the Coordinator of the Engineering Program. Dr. Angulo has 
a pure B.A. and M.A. in Mathematics from Hunter College of CUNY, and 
an M.S and Ed.D in Mathematics Education from Columbia University. 
She strongly believes that students’ mathematics achievements can be 
significantly improved if teachers in the classroom demystify the 
mathematics subject and are able to develop a community of learners. 
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Allen Wolmer is Head of the Mathematics Department at Yeshiva 
Atlanta High School in Atlanta, Georgia. He received his undergraduate 
degree in Civil Engineering from The Cooper Union and his M.S. degree 
in Engineering Mechanics from Columbia University School of 
Engineering. Mr. Wolmer was an Adjunct Mathematics Instructor at 
Georgia Perimeter College for over a decade before assuming his current 
position at Yeshiva Atlanta. Mr. Wolmer teaches a wide range of 
mathematics courses, from Algebra I through AP Calculus AB, all with a 
SMART Board. His professional interests focus on the effective use of 
classroom technologies, such as interactive whiteboards, to produce 
useful mathematics lessons in the high school and college classroom. Mr. 
Wolmer can be reached at AlWolmer@aol.com 

Leonid Khazanov is an associate professor of mathematics at the 
Borough Of Manhattan Community College in NYC. He received his 
undergraduate degree in mathematics and mathematics education from the 
Pedagogical University of St. Petersburg, Russia and his Ed. D in 
mathematics education from Teachers College, Columbia University. At 
BMCC Leonid Khazanov teaches Precalculus, Calculus, and 
developmental mathematics courses. His professional interests within the 
field of mathematics education include examining students’ 
misconceptions and finding productive approaches for resolving them. 
Dr. Khazanov can be reached at LKhazanov@bmcc.cuny.edu 

Dino Sossi studies Instructional Technology and Media at Columbia 
University. He earned his Master of Philosophy degree at the University 
of Cambridge. Dino Sossi worked as a Producer/Video Journalist. His 
stories have aired on CNN, IFC, Discovery, MTV Canada, CBC, CTV 
and MuchMoreMusic and have included Grammy Award-winning artists 
Rod Stewart and Nelly Furtado as well as Grammy-nominated artists 
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Meryl Streep. 

Shenetta Richardson obtained her Master of Arts in Computing in 
Education at Teachers College, Columbia University. Her interests in 
education include how effective technology will be used in the classroom 
and, if made available, how or if students will become dependent on 
technology to learn. Shenetta has a bachelor degree in Office 
Administration and a minor in Business Management from Alabama 
State University. She is currently working as a System Engineer at 
Columbia University working with videoconferencing, web casting, and 
programming the Columbia University telephone system, etc. It is also 
her goal and interest to assist others in learning to integrate computing 
technology skills into their lives so that they are prepared for the future. 
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